Updated 5-25-2023

Day of Sale | Successful Bid

Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Sept. 6,2022 | 039B170 S 5,904.01 40,000.00 34,095.99 [Bedford, Tommy L. Ezeora, Joel

Perez, Edward. & Butler, Monika &
Sept. 6, 2022 | 044A 022 S 5,232.36 40,000.00 34,767.64 |Hyazamin V. Stroman, David Spark

Bull Daggaz JCVision and
Sept. 6,2022 | 047A 204 $12,024.31 18,000.00 5,975.69 |Holdem, LLC Associateslnc.

Liberty
Sept. 6,2022 | 055C 197 S 3,764.49 6,000.00 2,235.51 |Construction, Inc. Pittman, Winston

Martin-Bruce Ryon Place
Sept. 6, 2022 | 055C 255 S 6,000.00 6,000.00| $ - |Enterprises, Inc Investments, LLC

White, Henry and

Sept. 6, 2022 123 005 S 1,660.03 11,000.00 9,339.97 |Richardson, Byron Deidre

Johnson, Robert C.
Sept. 6, 2022 | 238A 087 S 618.22 1,100.00 | $ 481.78 (& Georgia M. Green, Cordarriel

Jacobs, Michael Cummings, Judy &
Sept. 6,2022 | 238B 109 S 1,602.28 8,000.00 6,397.72 |David Patrick, John C.
Sept. 6,2022 | 238B 144 S 1,940.56 1,940.56 | S - [Davis, Ruth M. Woodland Lakes POA

Haynes, Michael A. Everhart, Dennis
Sept. 6,2022 | 238B 175 S 1,830.83 1,830.83| S - |& Sheree S. Steven

Hardy, Vernon W. EXCESS FUNDS
Sept. 6, 2022 | 238D 052 S 1,243.38 3,200.00 1,956.62 |& Et Al Hardy, Vernon W  [CLAIMED
Sept. 6, 2022 | 238D 193 S 1,760.79 1,760.79 | S - |Burdette, Thurman Robinson, Esther
Sept. 6, 2022 | 238D 261 S 1,731.48 1,731.48| S - |Jones, Carl A. Woodland Lakes POA

Watkins, William C.
Sept. 6, 2022 | 238D 281 S 1,364.02 1,364.02| $ - (& Dorothy C. Woodland Lakes POA

Cummings, Judy & [EXCESS FUNDS

Sept. 6, 2022 | 260A 162 S 1,372.65 16,000.00 14,627.35 |Venegas, Luis A Roxanne Howerton [CLAIMED




Sept. 6,2022 [ 260C 005 S 1,917.57( $ 1,917.57| S - [Stawser, Richard Jones, Adrian T
Patrick, John &

Sept. 6,2022 | 260C 054 S 1,931.98| $ 1,931.98( S - |Robinson, Anthony Cummings, Judy
Walker Land Sales,

Sept. 6,2022 | 260C 063 S 640.72| $ 700.00( $ 59.28 |Inc Pittman, Winston
Walker Land Sales,

Sept. 6,2022 | 260C 064 S 640.72( $ 640.72( $ - |Inc Pittman, Winston
Walker Land Sales,

Sept. 6,2022 | 260C 065 S 640.72| $ 850.00( S 209.28 (Inc Pittman, Winston
Robinson,

Sept. 6,2022 | 260C 084 S 1,716.62| $ 1,716.62 | S - [Shanethea Pittman, Winston
Sims, John

Sept. 6, 2022 | 045D 084 S 10,502.61 NB S - [McArthur NB
Washington, Edlaie

Sept. 6, 2022 | 238A 074 S 2,865.16 NB S - (& Mignon NB

Sept. 6, 2022 | 238B 053 S 2,093.72 NB S - |Poling, Sean NB
Byers, Thomas H. &

Sept. 6, 2022 | 238B 086 S 1,226.16 NB S - |Jacquelyn M. NB
Haldeman, Harry E.

Sept. 6, 2022 | 238B 185 S 1,224.83 NB S - |& Gloria J NB
Taylor, Julius

Sept. 6, 2022 | 238B 240 S 3,205.45 NB S - |[Raymond NB
Corbett, Anthony

Sept. 6, 2022 | 238D 092 S 1,970.04 NB S - |A. & Clemmie L NB

Sept. 6, 2022 | 260A 059 S 2,562.88 NB S - |Roberson, W. A. NB

Sept. 6, 2022 | 260C 055 S 2,087.28 NB S - |Rogers, Shawn P NB

Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments




Veterans Realty,

EXCESS FUNDS

Sept. 7, 2021 |040D 091 S 1,715.48 37,000.00 | $ 35,284.52 |LLC Williams, Muhammad|CLAIMED
Colonial Park
Sept. 7, 2021 |047A 190 S 2,668.89 5,400.00 | $ 2,731.11 |Condominium Cox, Sharon
Secretary of
Sept. 7, 2021 |058D 049 S 7,424.35 98,000.00 | $ 90,575.65 |Veterans Affairs Ezeora, Joel
Golden, Stafford Robertson, Willie |EXCESS FUNDS
Sept. 7, 2021 {103 100 S 1,680.47 24,000.00 | S 22,319.53 [Est Mae CLAIMED
Sept. 7, 2021 |120 005 S 3,306.47 27,500.00 | S 24,193.53 |Brunson, Viola Est Pittman Jr, Winston
Way, Roger J., Heirs
Sept. 7, 2021 (220B 025 S 1,722.58 8,700.00 | $ 6,977.42 |Known & Unknown Cox, Sharon
S 3,833.84 EXCESS FUNDS
($2,240.84 PARTIALLY
Sept. 7, 2021 (238A 066 S 666.16 4,500.00 remaining) Fields, Elizabeth C | Williams, Muhammad|CLAIMED,
EXCESS FUNDS
Sept. 7, 2021 |238A 078 S 795.75 3,000.00 | $ 2,204.25 |Cook-Redd, Lollie Williams, Malcolm X [CLAIMED
EXCESS FUNDS
Sept. 7, 2021 |238B 154 S 665.38 1,800.00 | $ 1,134.62 |Richey, Jim Pittman Jr, Winston [CLAIMED
EXCESS FUNDS
Sept. 7, 2021 |238B 267 S 665.38 2,500.00 | $ 1,834.62 |Scott, Lewis H. Jr Pittman Jr, Winston [CLAIMED
Sept. 7, 2021 |238B 277 S 666.16 1,700.00 | $ 1,033.84 |Tapley, Shirley Ann | Pittman Jr, Winston
$  3,311.18 EXCESS FUNDS
($2,857.00 PARTIALLY
Sept. 7, 2021 |238D 053 S 1,188.82 4,500.00 remaining) Taylor, Beverly B. LRKX, LLC CLAIMED,
Sept. 7, 2021 |238D 077 S 710.38 2,300.00( $ 1,589.62 |Schwartz, Scott Robertson, Esther
Fordham, Patrick EXCESS FUNDS
Sept. 7, 2021 |238D 094 S 632.77 1,200.00 | $ 567.23 |Neil Forgotten Dreams LLC|CLAIMED
Sept. 7, 2021 (238D 132 S 1,594.08 1,600.00 | S 5.92 |Sloan, William, Jr Pittman Jr, Winston
Sept. 7, 2021 |238D 137 S 566.16 1,100.00 | $ 533.84 |Wesley, Timothy L Pittman Jr, Winston




EXCESS FUNDS

Sept. 7, 2021 (238D 138 S 684.29 2,000.00 1,315.71 (Wesley, Timothy L Pittman Jr, Winston |CLAIMED
Haynes, John A. & Williams, Patrick Eric |EXCESS FUNDS
Sept. 7, 2021 (238D 260 S 642.88 800.00( S 157.12 |Evelyn F. Il CLAIMED
Sept. 7, 2021 |238D 261 S 1,384.81 -1 S - |Jones, Carl A. NB
Watkins, William C.
Sept. 7, 2021 |238D 282 S 603.95 603.95( S - |Sr & Dorothy C. Maxwell, Shawn
Sept. 7, 2021 |240C 110 S 1,569.03 15,500.00 13,930.97 |Gordon, Lula Anne Williams, David
Secretary of
Sept. 7, 2021 (249A 021 S 2,109.17 6,300.00 4,190.83 |Housing And Urban | Smith, Ashley Nicole
Davis, Daniel L. &
Sept. 7, 2021 [260A 030 S 3,289.21 -1S - |Carolyn NB
Herron, Donald & Walton, James &
Sept. 7, 2021 |260B 105 $ 11,118.90 22,000.00 10,881.10 |Dorothy Jamie
Sept. 7, 2021 |281A 054 S 3,764.68 3,764.68| $ - [RTA, inc. Maxwell, Shawn
Sept. 7, 2021 {306 056 S 1,321.14 8,000.00 6,678.86 |Corbron, Paul Cox, Sharon
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Heirs Known &
Unknown of
Boatwright, EXCESS FUNDS
Feb. 4,2020 (023028 S 1,808.46 5,000.00 3,191.54 |Leeomie, Deceased Minnes, Ellis J CLAIMED
Timpanaro, EXCESS FUNDS
Feb. 4, 2020 |(046D050 S 7,077.14 8,000.00 | S 922.86 [Stephen Phelps Holdings, LLC |CLAIMED
Bull Daggaz
Feb. 4,2020 (047A204 $9,532.27 NB NB Holdem, LLC NB
Liberty
Feb. 4, 2020 (055C197 $2,923.34 NB NB Construction, Inc. NB
Southern Coastal
Feb. 4, 2020 (055C255 $30,122.39 NB NB Investors, Inc. NB




Heirs Known &
Unknown of Butler,

Alexander,
Feb. 4,2020 |190016 $5,770.57 NB NB Deceased NB
Feb. 4, 2020 (238B053 $1,629.54 NB NB Poling, Sean NB
Feb. 4,2020 |238B144 $1,385.78 NB NB Davis, Ruth M NB
Feb. 4, 2020 |238B175 $1,301.59 NB NB Haynes, Michael A NB
Hayes, Larry &
Feb. 4, 2020 (238D123 S 1,225.17 1,225.17 Dean, Diane Deason, Randall J
Feb. 4,2020 (238D132 $1,157.62 NB NB Sloan, William Jr NB
Heirs Known &
Unknown of
Burdette, Thurman,
Feb. 4,2020 |238D193 $1,096.11 NB NB deceased NB
Feb. 4, 2020 (238D261 $1,027.38 NB NB Jones, Carl A NB
Heirs Known &
Unknown of Davis,
Daniel L Deceased
Feb. 4,2020 |260A030 $2,786.25 NB NB & Carolyn NB
Feb. 4, 2020 |260A059 $2,018.94 NB NB Roberson, W A NB
Strawser, Richard
a/k/a Stawser,
Feb. 4, 2020 |260C005 $1,373.74 NB NB Richard NB
Feb. 4, 2020 (260C054 $1,389.91 NB NB D NB
Rodgers, Shawn
Patrick a/k/a
Feb. 4, 2020 |260C055 $1,620.37 NB NB Rogers, Shawn P NB
Robinson,
Feb. 4,2020 |260C084 $1,132.60 NB NB Shanethea NB




Ashburn, T Norvell
a/k/a Ashburn,

Feb. 4, 2020 |261D077 S 2,893.31 NB NB Norvell T NB
Ashburn, T Norvell EXCESS FUNDS
Feb. 4, 2020 |262B040 S 15,818.25| $ 18,000.00 | $ 2,181.75 |a/k/a Ashburn, Phelps Holdings, LLC |CLAIMED
Ashburn, T Norvell EXCESS FUNDS
Feb. 4, 2020 (262B057 S 1,250.04( $ 1,500.00 | $ 249.96 |a/k/a Ashburn, Martin, Reginald G [CLAIMED
Feb. 4, 2020 (273001BO1 | S 626.96( $ 850.00| $ 223.04 (Speir, Kenneth D Rushton, Robert
Ashburn, T Norvell
a/k/a Ashburn,
Feb. 4, 2020 [281A099 $1,898.93 NB NB Norvell T NB
Feb. 4, 2020 (288004 $31,321.58 NB NB Hampton Island LLC NB
Feb. 4, 2020 (288008 $34,716.65 NB NB Hampton Island LLC NB
Fulcrum Loan
Feb. 4, 2020 [289013 S 1,488.26| S 1,500.00 | $ 11.74 |Holdings LLC Rushton, Robert
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
The Secretary of
Nov. 5, 2019 |036A013 $684.056( $ 2,500.00 | S 1,815.95 |Veterans Affairs Miness, Ellis J
Heirs Known &
Unknown of
Thomas, Irene,
Nov. 5, 2019 |046B274 S 1,471.06|$ 4,000.00 | S 2,528.94 |Deceased Miness, Ellis J
Nov. 5, 2019 [049D010 $1,044.99( $ 1,044.99 NB Hart, Herschel NB
EXCESS FUNDS
Nov. 5, 2019 [055C021 S 498.32| S 550.00 | S 51.68 |Miller, Franklin Carolyn Smith Carter |[CLAIMED
Nov. 5, 2019 |058C116 S 1,376.82|$ 5,000.00 | S 3,621.53 |Phabian, David Dana D Ingram
EvansT& T
Nov. 5, 2019 (071D037 S 1,386.45 NB NB Investments, LLC NB
Nov. 5, 2019 |10332MH S 726.63|$ 726.63 | $ - |Chaires, Kristie L. |Miness, Ellis J




Nov.

5,2019

10578MH

$2,374.12

NB

NB

Unknown Owner

NB

Nov.

5,2019

10617MH

S

521.02

521.02

Unknown Owner

Miness, Ellis J

Nov.

5,2019

148031

S

855.53

1,500.00

644.47

Bryant, Evelyn

Derrick & Lavanda
Spencer

EXCESS FUNDS
CLAIMED

Nov.

5,2019

166A014

S

939.56

3,200.00

2,259.76

Roberts, Alphonso

Derrick & Lavanda
Spencer

Nov.

5,2019

166A026

S 1,104.25

1,104.25

Heirs Known &
Unknown of
Holland,
Marguerite;
Richardson, Lewis;
Richardson,
Lawrence &
Richardson, Joe W.,
Jr., Deceased

Louise R. Brown

Nov.

5,2019

213B064

$1,087.37

NB

NB

Shady Oaks
Townhomes LLC

NB

Nov.

5,2019

219A004

$1,570.14

NB

NB

Heirs Known &
Unknown of
Gurganus, Kathryn
M. F/K/A Kathy M.
Gibson, Deceased.

NB

Nov.

5,2019

238B025

S

661.23

661.23

Fritts, Bruce

Matthew & Casey
Willard

Nov.

5,2019

238B026

s

654.03

654.03

Fritts, Bruce

Matthew & Casey
Willard

Nov.

5, 2019

238D092

$1,350.80

NB

NB

Corbett, Anthony
A. & Heirs Known &
Unknown of
Corbett, Clemmie
L., Deceased

NB

Nov.

5, 2019

271003

$1,032.47

NB

NB

Reflections House,
LLC

NB

Nov.

5,2019

271007

$1,024.74

NB

NB

Reflections House,
LLC

NB




Nov. 5, 2019 |281A054 $12,908.58 NB NB RTA, Inc. NB
Vinings Realty
Nov. 5, 2019 [289007 $997.29 NB NB Ventures, LLC NB
Hampton Island
Nov. 5, 2019 |289016 $2,383.01 NB NB Management, Inc. NB
Hampton Island,
Nov. 5, 2019 |289025 S 846.92| $ 846.92 | S - |LLC Jason E. Patten
Heirs Known &
Unknown of Wells,
Dewey L., Deceased
& Kitchens, Glenn
E. & Nadine C. &
Nov. 5, 2019 |3602MH $827.88 NB NB Lucile NB
Pena-Gonzalez,
Nov. 5, 2019 |4990MH $471.16 NB NB Avelino NB
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
June 5
2019 029B 116 S 846.18 | NB NB Quinnco NB
June 5 EXCESS FUNDS
2019 046B 158 S 1,45890 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 3,041.10 (Barbee, J Ezeora, Joel CLAIMED
June 5
2019 047A 190 S 1,475.91 | NB NB Colonial NB
June 5 EXCESS FUNDS
2019 056C 036 S 746.08 | $§ 2,200.00 | $ 1,453.92 |Moore, R Stewart, Merita CLAIMED
June 5 EXCESS FUNDS
2019 056C 040 S 579.54 | S 800.00 220.46 |Moore, R Barrett, Henry CLAIMED
June 5 EXCESS FUNDS
2019 056C 044 S 579.54 | S 1,000.00 420.46 |Moore, R Barrett, Henry CLAIMED
June 5
2019 103 081 S 1,254.75 | $ 1,500.00 245.25 |Walthour, S White, Deidre
June 5 EXCESS FUNDS
2019 121 048 S 1,883.23 | $ 15,000.00 | $  13,116.77 |Mosley, Latonia Ezeroa, Joel CLAIMED
June 5
2019 129 020 S 1,074.74 | $ 4,000.00 | S 2,925.26 |Alvin, Rosa Jackson, Joyce




June 5

2019 141 063 4,832.69 | S 8,000.00 3,167.31 [Jones, Blan Spencer, Derrick
June 5

2019 143 057 1,025.41 | S 1,025.41 - Roberts, W Phelps, Marc

June 5

2019 144 001 672.01 | NB NB Robertson M NB

June 5

2019 167A 004 1,324.25 | $ 1,324.25 - Guest, C Raymond, Austin
June 5 EXCESS FUNDS

2019 167C017 1,624.88 | $ 2,550.00 925.17 |Brown, John Roundtree, Dorothy [CLAIMED
June 5

2019 184 004 1,590.25 | $ 4,000.00 2,909.75 (Parker, Paul Wynn, Raymond
June 5

2019 238B 086 649.04 | NB NB Byers NB

June 5

2019 238B 185 647.50 | NB NB Haldeman H NB

June 5

2019 238D 098 644.72 | S 644.72 - Robbins, W Woodland LakesPOA
June 5

2019 238D 099 644.72 | S 644.72 - Robbins, W Woodland LakesPOA
June 5

2019 238D 214 703.63 | S 703.63 - Congers, S Woodland LakesPOA
June 5

2019 260A 057 653.96 | $ 653.96 - McMillan, L Patrick, John
June 5

2019 262C 044 1,094.56 | S 1,094.56 - Tyler, David Phelps, Marc
June 5

2019 270001 2,139.35 | $ 2,139.35 - Fulcrum Jackson, Joyce
June 5

2019 270002 1,178.02 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 270003 3,928.33 | $ 3,928.33 - Fulcrum Raymond, Austin




June 5

2019 270014 1,472.43 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 270016 1,395.12 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 270017 1,439.63 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 270018 1,457.48 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 270019 1,439.63 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 270020 1,286.42 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 270001 BO1 2,642.13 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 271005 1,634.83 | S 1,634.83 Fulcrum Phelps, Marc
June 5

2019 271 008 998.88 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 271 009 918.94 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 288 006 1,250.24 | S 1,250.24 Fulcrum Phelps, Marc
June 5

2019 288 017 484.02 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 288 019 410.02 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 288 021 1,848.82 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 289 002 961.80 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 289 005 917.06 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 289 009 413.45 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5

2019 289018 678.11 | NB NB Fulcrum NB




June 5

2019 289 024 S 2,005.92 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5
2019 289 026 S 799.60 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5
2019 289 038 S 70,262.67 | NB NB Fulcrum NB
June 5
2019 306 067 S 4,094.35 |$ 7,000.00 | S 2,905.65 |Hill, Leroy Wedincamp, Daniel
June 5
2019 306 011 S 662.45 | NB NB Smith,James NB
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Hearn, Jerald V.
Estate & Heirs
Known & Unknown
of & Real Time
March 6 Staffing Services, 1/2 OF EXCESS
2018 016018 $14,553.83 | $ 65,000.00 | S 50,446.17(Inc. Butler, Monika FUNDS CLAIMED
Lyles, Gwendolyn
Estate & Heirs
March 6 Known & Unknown
2018 031B004 $3,007.61 NB NB|of NB
March 6 Brewton, Kimberly [Robert Bell Jr, EXCESS FUNDS
2018 044B277 S,4799.42 | $ 20,000.00 | S 15,200.58|Y. Investments Inc. CLAIMED
Sims, John
McArthur Estate &
March 6 Heirs Known &
2018 045D084 $7,340.24 NB NB|Unknown of NB




Colonial Coast
Development
Company & Bull

March 6 Daggaz
2018 047A204 $7,455.18 NB NB|Holdem, LLC NB
March 6 Emma Estates &
2018 051A066 $2,897.99( $§ 2,897.99 SO|Heirs Known & Ben Collins
Strickland, Charles
Estate & Heirs
March 6 Known & Unknown
2018 051C102 $929.70| $ 1,400.00 | $ 470.30]of Redmond Morris
Taylor, Johnnie
Mae Estate & Heirs
March 6 Known & Unknown
2018 055C001 $1,503.41 NB NB|of & Rosetta NB
March 6 Liberty
2018 055C085 $915.95 NB NB|Construction Inc NB
March 6 Liberty
2018 055C197 $1,770.84 NB NB|Construction Inc NB
Manous, Lee
Madison Estate &
March 6 Heirs Known & Robert Bell Jr, EXCESS FUNDS
2018 056A036 $5,734.70 $12,000.00 $6,265.30 [Unknown of Investments Inc. CLAIMED
Kohari, Ida Mae
Estate & Heirs
March 6 Known & Unknown [Robert Bell Jr, EXCESS FUNDS
2018 056D087 $3,693.26( $ 12,500.00 $8,806.74|of Investments Inc. CLAIMED
White, Charles
March 6 a/k/a White,
2018 082C037 $4,281.85( S 4,281.85 S0|Charles R Merita Stewart
March 6 EXCESS FUNDS
2018 107003 $2,916.86( S 9,100.00 | S 6,183.14|Jones, John A Ben Collins CLAIMED
Lloyd, George Will pay in full with
Estate & Heirs excess funds of
March 6 Known & Unknown |$2,765.67 from 140
2018 140013 $2,763.75 NFR NFR|of 018




Lloyd, George
Estate & Heirs
Known & Unknown

March 6 $6,520.72 of W Pauli Smith Mullice
2018 140018 (59,286.39) 9,286.39 | $ 2,765.67 \ Chad Smith
Stevens, Janie &
Willie Estate &
March 6 Heirs Known &
2018 141073 $8,560.57 $8,560.57 $0|Unknown of Pierce Services Inc
Holland,
Marguerite Estate
& Heirs Known &
Unknown of;
Richardson, Lewis;
Richardson,
Lawrence & Charmaine Gatlin,
March 6 Richardson, Joe W., [Brenda Linton, Jerry
2018 166C012 $3,321.23 3,321.23 So|Jr. Hargrove
Bacon, Affie &
Neater, James
Estates & Heirs
March 6 Known & Unknown
2018 167C011 $5,385.86 NB NB|of NB
Hart, James Estate
March 6 & Heirs Known & |W Pauli Smith Mullice
2018 186C024 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $0|Unknown of \ Chad Smith
Jones, Sylvia Mae
Estate & Heirs
March 6 Known & Unknown [Sheldon Curtis
2018 188062 $743.19 $1,050.00 | $ 306.81|of Arrindell
Butler, Alexander
Estate & Heirs
March 6 Known & Unknown
2018 190016 $4,728.29 NB NB|of NB




Washington, Edlaie
Estate & Heirs
Known & Unknown

March 6 of & Washington,
2018 238A074 $2,040.04 NB NB|Mignon NB
March 6
2018 238A084 S745.87 745.87 S0|Anderson, Earl L. Jr, [Redmond Morris
March 6
2018 238A085 $1,049.45 $1,049.45 S0|Powell, Davin L. Redmond Morris
March 6
2018 238B053 $1,108.62 NB NB|Poling, Sean NB
March 6 Haynes, Michael A.
2018 238B175 $775.06 NB NB|& Haynes, Sheree S.|NB
Bush, Joe Estate &
March 6 Heirs Known &
2018 238B202 $842.87 $842.87 $0|Unknown of Beverly Lewis
Taylor, Julius
Raymond Estate &
March 6 Heirs Known &
2018 238B240 $2,097.90 NB NB|Unknown of NB
LeCounte, Edith
Estate & Heirs
Known & Unknown
of; Alvin, Jimmy;
March 6 Williams, Francis &
2018 250C043 $1,494.23 $1,494.23 SO|Alvin, Lilla Mae Ben Collins
March 6
2018 260C005 $835.67 NB NB|Stawser, Richard NB
March 6 Yates, Christopher
2018 260C047 $804.49 NB NB|& Yates, Anette NB
March 6 Robinson, Anthony
2018 260C054 $853.37 NB NB|Dale NB




Rodgers, Shawn

March 6 Patrick a/k/a
2018 260C055 $1,084.26 NB NB|Rogers, Shawn P. NB
EXCESS FUNDS
March 6 Turtle Lake CLAIMED
2018 270025 $8,829.44| $ 30,000.00 | $ 21,070.56|Holdings LLC PFS Group, LLC (APPLIED)
Harper, Patrick B
Estate & Heirs
March 6 Known & Unknown
2018 280C066 $1,814.83 $1,814.83 $0|of Kevin Butler
March 6 Etherton, Marvin &
2018 281A052 $2,081.10 NB NB|Yong, Nam Whittle [NB
EXCESS FUNDS
UNAVAILABLE
March 6 (APPLIED TO
2018 289035 $10,849.56( $ 30,000.00 | $ 19,150.44|Deluca-Eat LLC PFS Group, LLC AMT DUE)
March 6
2018 306061 $11,502.42| $ 11,502.42 SO|Polite, Lawrence Mathew Butler
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Thomas, Irene
Estate & Heirs
Known & Unknown
May1l 2018 (046B153 $7,201.00 $9,000.00| $ 1,799.00(of Frasier, Charles
Freedom Solid State EXCESS FUNDS
May 1 2018 |071D105 S 61.22 $6,000.00| $ 5,938.78|Development, LLC |Construction, LLD CLAIMED
May 1 2018 [103013 Johnson, Tiffany
Lee, Charles E., Jr.
Estate & Heirs
Known & Unknown
May 1 2018 [10305MH S 1,225.48 NB NB|of NB




Singleton, John, Sr.
Estate & Heirs
Known & Unknown

May1 2018 (103070 NB NB NB|of NB
May1l 2018 [10551MH NB NB NB|Unknown Owner |NB
James, Minnie
May1 2018 [10730MH NB NB NB NB
Holmes, Raymond,
Sr. Estate & Heirs
Known & Unknown
May1l 2018 |10731MH NB NB NB|of NB
May 1l 2018 (10791MH NB NB NB|Unknown Owner NB
Bacon, Affie &
Neater, James
Estates & Heirs
Known & Unknown
May1l 2018 (167C011 $5,526.41 $9,500.00| $ 3,973.59|of Cox, Sharon
EXCESS FUNDS
May1l 2018 |167C034 $1,267.57 $4,500.00( S 3,232.43|Lexley, Essie Brown |Jones, Nathan & Daisy |CLAIMED
Squire, Sandra Faye
May1l 2018 |169016 NB NB|& Maurice, Keisha |NB
Jones, Deborah
May 1l 2018 |1720MH NB NB|Ann NB
May1l 2018 |189016 NB NB|Norman, Louis H. |[NB
Blue, Diana
May 1 2018 |208045 NB NB NB
May 1 2018 |238B219 NB NB|Lane, Charles NB
McNeil, Willie
James Estate &
Heirs Known &
May 1 2018 |238D067 $689.78 $1,000.00( $ 310.22|Unknown of Jeffers, Brett




Hayes, Larry &

Solid State

May1 2018 [238D122 $694.41 694.41 $0|Dean, Diane Construction, LLD
Hayes, Larry &
May 1l 2018 (238D123 NB NB|Dean, Diane NB
May 1l 2018 (250C020 NB NB|Lambert, Annie NB
Davis, Daniel L.
Estate & Heirs
Known & Unknown
May 1 2018 |260A030 NB NB|of & Davis, Carolyn [NB
May 1l 2018 |260A036 $692.23 $692.23 $0(Sikes, Steven Slade [Jones, Nathan & Daisy
Taylor, Julius
Raymond Estate &
Heirs Known &
May 1l 2018 |260A063 $500.00 $500.00 $0|Unknown of Wortham, Tina
Robinson,
May1l 2018 |260C084 NB NB|Shanethea NB
Ashburn, T. Norvell
May 1l 2018 (261D077 NB NB NB
Ashburn, T. Norvell EXCESS FUNDS
May 1l 2018 (261D117 $1,455.38 $3,400.00( S 1,944.62 Jeffers, Brett CLAIMED
Ashburn, T. Norvell
May1 2018 [262B001 NB NB NB
Ashburn, T. Norvell [Solid State EXCESS FUNDS
May 1l 2018 (262B031 $1,659.65 $5,500.00( S 3,840.35 Construction, LLD CLAIMED
Ashburn, T. Norvell [Solid State EXCESS FUNDS
May 1 2018 |262B032 $1,613.59 $3,500.00( $ 1,886.41 Construction, LLD CLAIMED




Ashburn, T. Norvell

EXCESS FUNDS

May 1 2018 (262B033 $1,737.67 $2,500.00( $ 762.33 Pillips, Richard CLAIMED
Ashburn, T. Norvell EXCESS FUNDS
May 1l 2018 |262B034 $1,920.47 $3,500.00| $ 1,579.53 Pillips, Richard CLAIMED
Ashburn, T. Norvell EXCESS FUNDS
May 1 2018 (262B035 $1,733.35 $4,100.00| $ 2,366.65 Pillips, Richard CLAIMED
Ashburn, T. Norvell
May 1l 2018 |262B040 NB NB NB
Ashburn, T. Norvell
May 1 2018 [262B057 NB NB NB
Ashburn, T. Norvell
May 1 2018 |280A015 NB NB NB
Ashburn, T. Norvell
May1 2018 [280C076 NB NB NB
Ashburn, T. Norvell
May 1 2018 |281A020 NB NB NB
Ashburn, T. Norvell
May1l 2018 [281A099 NB NB NB
Ashburn, T. Norvell
May 1 2018 282002 NB NB NB
May 1 2018 [288004 NB NB|Hampton Island LLC{NB
May 1l 2018 (288008 NB NB|Hampton Island LLC{NB




Bush, James; Hill,
Leroy & Hill, Alma
Estates & Heirs
Known & Unknown

May 1 2018 |306071 $1,559.91 $3,500.00( $ 1,944.09|of Wedincamp, Daniel
Oxford, Milton
Estate & Heirs
Known & Unknown

May 1 2018 |324009 $428.84 $1,810.00 $ 1,381.16|of Cox, Sharon

May 1 2018 |3447MH NB NB|Marshall, Nancy Q. [NB
Mackey, Ernest F.,
Sr. Estate & Heirs
Known & Unknown
of; Mackey, Ernest
F., Jr. & Mackey,

May1l 2018 (3701MH NB NB|Laura S. NB

May 1l 2018 |3818MH NB NB|Oliveria, Cathy Ann |NB

May1l 2018 [5066MH NB NB|Jung, Kathy H. NB
Johnson, Katherine
G.

May 1l 2018 (5451MH NB NB NB
Heafey, Robert T. &
Carol

May1l 2018 [5616MH NB NB NB

May 1l 2018 |6795MH NB NB|Fuller, Ceasar lll NB

May 1l 2018 |8981MH NB NB|Wells, Gregg NB
Robertson, Cedric

May 1l 2018 [9040MH NB NB|Jamarco NB

Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments




Sept4 2018 [059A171 2,554.40 $16,000.00( S 13,445.60(Gall, Rhonda Jean Joel Ezeora
Heirs Known &
Unknown of Jones, EXCESS FUNDS
Sept4 2018 (101043 2,993.80 $5,800.00( $ 2,806.14(Annie P., Deceased |Merita Stewart CLAIMED
Heirs Known &
Unknown of
Singleton, John, Sr.,
Sept4 2018 [103070 1,364.49 $9,000.00( $ 7,635.51|Deceased Harry L. Robertson
Sept4 2018 (10735MH 1,344.32 PULLED PULLED|Johnson, Tiffany PULLED
Unknown Owner
Sept4 2018 (11037MH 964.26 PULLED PULLED PULLED
Sept4 2018123020 1,841.91 PULLED PULLED|Lumpkin, Curtis PAID IN FULL
Heirs Known &
Unknown of Bowers,
Beatrice & Bowers,
Sept4 2018 (141019 3,694.51 NB NB|Joe L., Deceased NB
North Lyman Hall,
Sept4 2018 157001 5,218.76 NB NB|LLC NB
Roberts, Simon &
Sept4 2018 |161C026 2,894.65 $2,894.65 S0[(Mary Lane, Kevin
Sept4 2018 (2001MH 1,300.33 PULLED PULLED|Frasier, Diana PULLED
Sept4 2018 (2021MH 1,067.68 NB NB|Ovitt, Crystal Evette |NB
Pearson, Regina
Sept4 2018 (2068MH 2,685.64 NB NB|Mullins NB
Blue, Diana
Sept4 2018 [208045 4,483.58 NB NB NB
EXCESS FUNDS
Sept4 2018 (213D048 3,530.64 $35,000.00( S 31,964.36|Butler, Phyllis A. Jim Woods CLAIMED
Sept4 2018 (213D049 1,929.26 $20,000.00( S 18,070.74|Butler, William R. Jim Woods




Sept4 2018 |2147MH 4,994.27 NB NB|Golden, Lewis NB

Sept4 2018 |238D162 782.73 $1,700.00 917.27|Green, Russell Donald R. Elrod
Heirs Known &
Unknown of
Burdette, Thurman,

Sept4 2018 |238D193 520.20 NB NB|Deceased NB

Sept4 2018 [238D261 540.75 NB NB|Jones, Carl A. NB
Heirs Known &
Unknown of Watkins,
William C., Deceased
& Watkins, Dorothy

Sept4 2018 [238D281 533.01 NB NBJ|C. NB

Sept4 2018 |250C020 1,650.08 $1,650.08 $0.00|Lambert, Annie Leila Williams
Ashburn, T. Norvell

Sept4 2018 |261D077 1,972.20 NB NB NB
Ashburn, T. Norvell

Sept4 2018 |262B001 8,253.76 $8,253.76 $0.00 NB
Ashburn, T. Norvell

Sept4 2018 (262B040 11,215.79 NB NB NB
Ashburn, T. Norvell

Sept4 2018 |262B057 793.63 NB NB NB
Ashburn, T. Norvell

Sept4 2018 [280A015 4,247.51 NB NB NB

Sept4 2018 [280A033 1,272.72 $1,272.72 $0.00|Jaimes, Jorge Andre Smith




Sept 4

2018

281A020

5,026.69

$5,026.69

$0.00

Ashburn, T. Norvell

Jeff Dube

Sept 4

2018

282002

624.28

$624.28

$0.00

Ashburn, T. Norvell

Dyanne C Hunter

Sept 4

2018

3081MH

1,760.03

PULLED

PULLED

Dykes, Carl R.

PULLED

Sept 4

2018

3118MH

2,920.13

NB

NB

Roberson, Linda
Gayle

NB

Sept 4

2018

3320MH

884.40

NB

NB

Stephens, Marvin E.
Mrs.

NB

Sept 4

2018

3419MH

421.66

NB

NB

Heirs Known &
Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased &
Dykes, Carl E. &
Sheila

NB

Sept 4

2018

3423MH

408.61

NB

NB

Heirs Known &
Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased

NB

Sept 4

2018

3425MH

408.61

NB

NB

Heirs Known &
Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased

NB

Sept 4

2018

3428MH

408.61

NB

NB

Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased

NB

Sept 4

2018

3429MH

408.61

NB

NB

Heirs Known &
Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased

NB

Sept 4

2018

3431MH

408.61

NB

NB

Heirs Known &
Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased

NB




Sept 4

2018

3432MH

408.61

NB

NB

Heirs Known &
Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased

NB

Sept 4

2018

3433MH

408.61

NB

NB

Heirs Known &
Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased

NB

Sept 4

2018

3435MH

448.48

NB

NB

Heirs Known &
Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased

NB

Sept 4

2018

3437MH

427.40

$500.00

72.60

Heirs Known &
Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased &
Sapp, David M.

Ellis Miness

Sept 4

2018

3441MH

427.82

$427.82

$0.00

Heirs Known &
Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased

Ellis Miness

Sept 4

2018

3453MH

432.16

NB

NB

Heirs Known &
Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased

NB

Sept 4

2018

3455MH

427.40

NB

NB

Heirs Known &
Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased

NB

Sept 4

2018

3466MH

2,155.77

NB

NB

Heirs Known &
Unknown of
Strickland, Ernest,
Deceased

NB

Sept 4

2018

3471MH

408.61

NB

NB

Heirs Known &
Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased &
Dykes, Carl E.

NB




Heirs Known &
Unknown of Lupo,
Elovie D., Deceased &

Sept4 2018 (3474MH S 408.61 NB NB|Dykes, Carl E. NB
Sept4 2018 |3574MH S 1,299.92 PULLED PULLED(|Frasier, Diana PULLED
Sept4 2018 (4042MH S 1,051.69 NB NB|Hall, Clarence S. NB
Sept4 2018 (4146MH S 765.84 PULLED PULLED|Carr, Wanda C. PULLED
Sept4 2018 (4214MH S 2,968.13 PULLED PULLED|Short, James J. PULLED
Sept4 2018 (4465MH S 704.47 PULLED PULLED|Martinez, Rosalia PULLED
Dykes, Lance R.
Sept4 2018 (4557MH S 1,632.80 NB NB NB
Sept4 2018 |5024MH S 514.80 NB NB|Unknown of Nelson, [NB
Mary E., Deceased
Sept4 2018 (5763MH S 1,197.72 NB NB NB
Malone, Donald
Sept4 2018 |5806MH S 1,007.71 NB NB|Joshua NB
Eagan, Ronald R.
Sept4 2018 [5934MH S 1,393.64 NB NB NB
Sept4 2018 [6478MH S 643.42 $650.00| $ 6.58|Reynolds, Gregory  |Ellis Miness
Sept4 2018 [6692MH S 768.78 $3,000.00| $ 2,231.22|Agostinelli, Lorenzo  |Ellis Miness
Sept4 2018 [6796MH S 2,685.59 NB NB|leffcoat, Stacey, Jr. [NB
EXCESS FUNDS
Sept4 2018 (7091MH S 3,917.83 $4,000.00( $ 82.17|Landon, Tony M. Ellis Miness CLAIMED
Sept4 2018 (7326MH S 2,488.68 NB NB|(Britton, Franklin NB

Sept4 2018 |7705MH S 2,173.55 PULLED PULLED|Lumpkin, Elvira PULLED




Sept4 2018 (7792MH S 1,125.98 PULLED PULLED|Slade, Belinda D. PULLED
Sept4 2018 (7925MH S 974.99 PULLED PULLED|Robinson, Cintretta |PULLED
Sept4 2018 (8092MH S 3,419.54 NB NB|Lumpkin, Willie F. NB
Sept4 2018 |8301MH S 1,601.90 NB NB|Brown, Valarie D. NB
Daniels, Jacqueline
Sandra K.
Sept4 2018 |9838MH S 1,014.09 PULLED PULLED PULLED
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Heirs Known &
Unknown of
Knowlton, James,
Deceased &
Nov6 2018 (034C016 S 84752 | $ 3,500.00( $ 2,652.48 [Knowlton, Sharon Marc C Phelps
Heirs Known &
Unknown of
Thompson, James H.
& Thompson,
Beaulah M,,
Deceased EXCESS FUNDS
Nov6 2018 |036A011 S 4,163.12( $ 10,000.00( $ 5,836.88 Denise L. Harris CLAIMED
Secretary Of EXCESS FUNDS
Nov6 2018 (050D103 S 5,167.80]| S 45,000.00| S 39,832.20 |Veterans Affairs Colatech Capital LLC CLAIMED
051D002 Heirs Known &
Unknown of McClure,
Steve, Deceased
Home Alterations and
Nov6 2018 S 450.23 | § 1,200.00( $ 749.77 Repairs
Secretary Of
Veterans Affairs VA  [Azcan U S Residential |EXCESS FUNDS
Nov6 2018 |063C039 S 600871 $ 75,000.00| $ 68,991.29 |Regional Loan Center |Real Estate Corp CLAIMED




Green Tree Servicing,
LLC f/k/a Green Tree
Financial Servicing

Nov6 2018140025 4,259.29 NB NB Corporation NB
EXCESS FUNDS
Nov6 2018 |166D004 1,324.85 6,000.00 4,675.15 |Greene, Gwendolyn |Harold Terry Mikel CLAIMED
Roberts, Mannie Jr.
Nov6 2018 (189018 902.93 1,000.00 97.07 Deidre Anderson White
Heirs Known &
Unknown of
Ferguson, Eddie, Home Alterations and
Nov6 2018 (213B017 708.82 1,600.00 891.18 |Deceased Repairs
Heirs Known &
Unknown of
Ferguson, Teresa, Home Alterations and
Nov6 2018 (213B018 1,328.26 2,000.00 671.74 |Deceased Repairs
Heirs Known &
Unknown of
Ferguson, Teresa, Williams, Courtney
Nov6 2018 (213B019 708.82 1,500.00 791.18 [Deceased James
Heirs Known &
Unknown of Haynes,
Mary F., Deceased &
Nov6 2018 (238B183 582.36 1,450.00 867.64 |Haynes, Ralph O. Woodland Lakes POA
Unknown of Riley, EXCESS FUNDS
Nov6 2018 (238B309 577.69 1,550.00 972.31 |[Emma Lee & Woodland Lakes POA  |CLAIMED
Heirs Known &
Unknown of Fleming,
Nov6 2018 (238D121 578.87 1,600.00 1,021.13 |Diane, Deceased Marc C Phelps
Nov6 2018 (238D262 937.57 2,600.00 1,662.43 |Jones, Carl A. Marc C Phelps
L M B Development, EXCESS FUNDS
Nov6 2018 |[241A057 4,738.27 9,500.00 4,761.73 |Inc. Marc C Phelps CLAIMED




Jones, Francis &

Ashley Mainer & Jawan

Nov6 2018 (252007 S 939.05 | $ 1,550.00 | $ 610.95 |Jessie May Richey
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
May 2 2017 (140 025 S 3,738.42 | NB S - GreenTree NB
May 2 2017 |2068MH S 2,060.69 | NB S - Pearson, R NB
May 2 2017 (219A 004 S 1,200.18 | NB S - Gurganus, K NB
May 2 2017 |222D 013 S 1,751.04 | $ 1,751.04 | $ - |Jones,) Dorothy Rhodes
May 2 2017 (238A 074 S 1,610.60 | NB Washington NB
May 2 2017 |238B 232 S 1,317.21 | $ 1,317.21 | $ - [Chappell, R Grunwald, Franklin J
May 2 2017 (238B 240 S 1,655.25 | NB Taylor, J NB
May 2 2017 (2461MH S 1,092.97 | NB Zeigler, D NB
May 2 2017 (260A 030 S 1,855.16 | NB Davis, D NB
May 2 2017 [260A 063 S 1,609.08 | NB S - Taylor, J NB
May 2 2017 (270 025 S 45,301.05 | NB S - Turtle Lake NB
May 2 2017 (281A 052 S 1,516.75 | NB S - Etherton, M NB
May 2 2017 (281A 054 S 10,915.01 | NB S - RTA, Inc. NB
May 2 2017 (288 004 S 27,429.81 | NB S - Hampton sl NB
May 2 2017 |288 008 S 28,517.18 | NB S - Hampton sl NB
May 2 2017 (289 035 S 49,790.54 | NB S - Deluca-Eat NB
EXCESS FUNDS
May 2 2017 (324 017 S 2,805.69| S 20,000.00 | S 17,194.31 | Jones, C W Pauli Mullice CLAIMED
May 2 2017 (3466MH S 1,542.98 | NB S - Strickland,E NB
May 2 2017 (3729MH S 2,997.18 | NB S - Mickel,John NB
May 2 2017 |5066MH S 4,581.82 | NB S - Jung, Kathy NB
$5,566.96
May 2 2017 |5626MH (52,500) S 2,500.00 | $ - Pigott, W Ladreama L. Moody
May 2 2017 (6051MH S 825.42 | NB S - Roberts, E NB
May 2 2017 |6246MH S 3,526.88|8$ 3,700.00 | S 173.12 Holmes, H Miness, Sam
May 2 2017 (7560MH S 1,427.29 | NB S - Rincon, N NB
May 2 2017 (7705MH S 1,922.17 | NB S - Lumpkin, E NB
May 2 2017 (8092MH S 2,669.77 | NB S - Lumpkin, W NB
May 2 2017 (9718MH S 820.58 | NB S - Ore, H NB




Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Dec. 6, 2016 |1991MH S 828.99 [ $ 828.99 ( $ - Riddle, Er Miness, Sam
Dec. 6, 2016 (4056MH S 1,447.35 [ NB S - Starr, Reb NB
Dec. 6,2016 |5082MH S 823.02 | S 823.02 (| $ - | Riddle, Er Miness, Sam
Dec. 6, 2016 (6087MH S 1,838.28 [ NB S - Mock, Edith NB
Dec. 6, 2016 |6095MH S 773.28 | $ 773.28 | § - | Riddle, Er Miness, Sam

Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Sept. 6, 2016 (046C 062 S 1,573.46 S 2,600.00 | $ 1,026.54 | Jenkins, T Miness, Sam
Sept. 6, 2016 [047A 204 S 5,766.89 | NB S - Colonial Co NB
Sept. 6, 2016 [050B 014 S 3,22545|$ 3,225.45 [ $ - | Guyton Al Johnny Southwell

EXCESS FUNDS

Sept. 6, 2016 |140 024 S 852.01| $ 2,000.00 | S 1,147.99 | Wms Linda Johnny Southwell CLAIMED
Sept. 6, 2016 (140 056 S 55541 S 555.41 | S - |Walker, M Johnny Southwell
Sept. 6, 2016 |166D 001 S 1,908.12 | S 6,000.00 | S 4,091.88 (Redding, N Miller Solo 401-K
Sept. 6, 2016 |{220D 051 S 760.50 | $ 1,100.00 | S 339.50 |Roberts, A Akra, Timothy
Sept. 6, 2016 |{238C 047 S 1,940.63 | S 5,000.00 | S 3,059.37 (Floyd, Ch Miller Solo 401-K
Sept. 6, 2016 |240D 007 S 1,562.01 |S 2,400.00 | S 837.99 |Fox, Martin Miller Solo 401-K

Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments

EXCESS FUNDS

Aug. 2, 2016 [055B 020 S 3,716.19 | S 9,000.00 | S 5,283.81 (Springlake Roger Owens CLAIMED
Aug. 2, 2016 |166B 011 S 3,116.41 | S 3,116.41 | $ - Faglier, J Abel Houston
Aug. 2, 2016 (238D 277 S 559.07 | $ 559.07 | $ - |Etherton, D James E McGarry
Aug. 2, 2016 |263A 005 S 2,16832 |$ 2,168.32  $ - Lee, Char Richard W Lindsey




Day of Sale

Successful Bid

Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
May. 3, 2016 (031 012 S 2,521.881S 2,521.88 | S - Roberts, W Oliver Wooten Trust
EXCESS FUNDS
May. 3, 2016 {058D 003 S 3,969.80 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 17,030.20 | Cofell, R Ray Futch CLAIMED
May. 3, 2016 |059A 114 S 3,809.82 |$ 22,200.00 [ $  18,390.18 [Brownlee, P Ray Futch
EXCESS FUNDS
May. 3, 2016 |060A 059 S 16,597.69 | $ 76,000.00 | $ 59,402.31 | The Waters PFS Group, LLC CLAIMED
May. 3, 2016 |140 025 S 3,299.33 NB S Green Tree No Bid
May. 3, 2016 |164 007 S 2,361.81 |$ 14,000.00 | S  11,638.19 |Tarett, S Oliver Wooten Trust
EXCESS FUNDS
May. 3, 2016 (180 005 S 2,167.55 | S 5,000.00 | S 2,832.45 | Parker, H Oliver Wooten Trust |CLAIMED
EXCESS FUNDS
May. 3, 2016 (209 068 S 3,770.10 | S 5,100.00 | S 1,329.90 | Grimes, Lee Mullice, Stephen CLAIMED
May. 3, 2016 (251 009 S 1,686.15 | $ 6,000.00 | S 4,313.85 |Alvin, Jimmy Oliver Wooten Trust
$4,864.48(CL EXCESS FUNDS
May. 3, 2016 (280C 100 AIMED) S 8,000.00 | S 3,135.52 | Nelson, S Oliver Wooten Trust |CLAIMED
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
EXCESS FUNDS
Dec. 1, 2015 |023 012 S 2422101 S 6,500.00 | $ 4,077.90 Hearn, J Butler, Monika S CLAIMED
Dec. 1, 2015 |026D 002 S 3,888.23 NB S - Indep Settle NB
Dec. 1, 2015 |031B 004 S 1,970.89 NB S - Lyles, Gwen NB
EXCESS FUNDS
Dec. 1, 2015 |034C 012 S 463481 |S 12,000.00 | $ 7,365.19 | Hearn, J Jones, Lewis A CLAIMED
EXCESS FUNDS
Dec. 1, 2015 |034C 025 S 1,169.27 | $ 1,300.00 | S 130.73 | Hearn, J Bryant Megan L CLAIMED
Dec. 1, 2015 (034C 037 S 1,303.27 | $ 1,303.27 | $ - |Hearn, ) Robinson, Mary A
Dec. 1, 2015 |049C 123 S 1,34732 | $ 1,400.00 | S 47.35 |Scales, Eva Cockerm, Morris A
Dec. 1, 2015 |051A 066 S 1,722.68 NB S - Roberts, C NB
Dec. 1, 2015 |(057C 150 S 2,469.13 | $ 2,469.13 | $ - |Thompson Lukkarinen, Eric A
Dec. 1, 2015 |058A 007 S 2,436.50 | S 2,436.50 | S - Short, J Ezeora, Joel
Dec. 1, 2015 [(058C 116 S 1,385.85 NB S - Phabian, D NB




EXCESS FUNDS

Dec. 1, 2015 (070C 151 S 243257 (S 3,500.00 | S 1,067.43 | Albergotti, S Cockerm, Morris & CLAIMED

Dec. 1, 2015 [103 079 S 605.48 | $ 700.00 | S 94.52 [Bacon, L Butler, Monika S

Dec. 1, 2015 (10397MH S 2,379.17 | $ 2,379.17 | $ - |Hearn, S Miness, Ellis J

Dec. 1, 2015 [10730MH S 1,258.08 NB S - James, M NB

Dec. 1, 2015 |166B 011 S 2,703.25 NB S - Faglier, J NB
EXCESS FUNDS

Dec. 1, 2015 (187B 088 S 2,69293 [S 3,200.00 | S 503.97 |Pinkney, A Miness, Ellis J CLAIMED
EXCESS FUNDS

Dec. 1, 2015 (209 134 S 1,17135 | S 2,600.00 | S 1,428.65 | Hearn, J Koren, Stephen CLAIMED

Dec. 1, 2015 [213B 064 S 414.71 NB S - Shady Oaks NB

Dec. 1, 2015 (222D 013 S 1,128.76 NB S - Jones, J NB

Dec. 1, 2015 (238A 074 S 972.88 NB S - Washington NB

Dec. 1, 2015 (238B 232 S 634.31 NB S - Chappell, R NB

Dec. 1, 2015 [238B 240 S 998.59 NB S - Taylor, J NB

Dec. 1, 2015 (2467MH S 2,830.06 NB S - Stewart, L NB

Dec. 1, 2015 [260A 063 S 962.62 NB S - Taylor, J NB

Dec. 1, 2015 [263A 005 S 1,545.27 NB S - Lee, Charles NB

Dec. 1, 2015 |270 025 S 42,048.04 NB S - Turtle Lake NB

Dec. 1, 2015 (288 004 S 25,237.56 NB S - Hampton Is NB

Dec. 1, 2015 |288 008 S 26,257.12 NB S - Hampton Is NB

Dec. 1, 2015 [289 035 S NB S - Deluca-Eat NB

Dec. 1, 2015 |5764MH S 1,738.69 | S 1,738.69 | $ - Rowland, L Miness, Ellis J

Dec. 1, 2015 (7705MH S 2,430.13 NB S - Lumpkin, E NB

Dec. 1, 2015 |7712MH S 79455 | S 794.55 | S - |Williams, V Miness, Ellis J

Dec. 1, 2015 |7792MH S 1,520.65 | S 1,520.65 | $ - Morrison, C Miness, Ellis J

Dec. 1, 2015 |8092MH S 1,870.57 NB S - Lumpkin, W NB

Dec. 1, 2015 (8133MH S 1,339.57 | $ 1,339.57 | $ - Lumpkin, W Miness, Ellis J

Dec. 1, 2015 |8779MH S 1,302.25 | $ 1,302.25 | $ - Kirkendall Bryant, Megan & John

Dec. 1, 2015 [9082MH S 4,090.30 NB S - |LeCounte NB

DUyOT o uTe T JUCTTSSTUT DT
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Oct. 5, 2015 |3118MH S 2,244.18 | No Bid S - Roberson, L No Bid




Day of Sale

Successful Bid

Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
July 7 2015 |055C 255 S 8,331.76 No Bid S - Martin-Bruce No Bid

July 7 2015 [189 035 S 511.80 | S 511.80  $ - Shoats, L Shoemaker, J

July 7 2015 |238B 144 S 598.18 No Bid S - Davis, Ruth No Bid

July 7 2015 [238D 092 S 591.86 No Bid S - Woodland Ld No Bid

July 7 2015 (249A 002 S 2,307.07 |$ 2,307.07 | $ - Bacon, V Shoemaker, J

July 7 2015 |[260A 059 S 1,180.61 No Bid S - |Roberson, W No Bid

July 7 2015 (260A 088 S 841.61 No Bid S - |Shuman, W No Bid

Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Richardson,
March 3 2015 |050D 007 S 500.38 | $ 500.38 | $ - Clanton Seay, Nadine
March 3 2015 |052D 017 S 678.42 | $ 4,500.00 | S 3,821.58 Kiilu, M Walton, Rudolph
EXCESS FUNDS

March 3 2015 |055B 015 S 253398 (S 9,000.00 | S 6,466.02 Leblond, J Owens, Roger L CLAIMED
March 3 2015 |058B 026 S 939.16 | $ 939.16 | $ - Taylor, J Seay, N\Ross L
March 3 2015 (102 010 S 3,40335 | S 7,800.00 | S 4,396.65 Jackson, C Seay, N\Ross L
March 3 2015 [166B 011 S 1,259.98 No Bid S - Faglier, J No Bid
March 3 2015 (187 005 S 2,411.79 | $ 6,500.00 | S 4,088.21 Hart, Hester Seay, N\Ross L
March 3 2015 |238A 074 S 582.44 No Bid S - Washington No Bid
March 3 2015 |238D 131 S 610.77 | $ 610.77 | S - Ivey, Helen Seay, N\Ross L
March 3 2015 |240C 009 S 907.11 | S 907.11 | S - Tomazin, R Quinette, John C
March 3 2015 |260A 063 S 567.57 No Bid S - Taylor, J No Bid
March 3 2015 |260C 058 S 531.11 | $ 531.11 | $ - lvy, Helen Seay, N\Ross L




March 3 2015 [260C 059 S 508.97 | $ 508.97 | $ - lvy, Helen Seay, N\Ross L
March 3 2015 (260C 060 S 537.03 | S 537.03 | $ - Ivey, M & H Seay, N\Ross L
March 3 2015 [260C 061 S 516.65 | S 516.65 | S - Ivey, M & H Seay, N\Ross L
March 3 2015 (260C 227 S 1,942.25 No Bid S - Jordan, Jeffr No Bid
March 3 2015 (270 025 S 39,831.96 No Bid S - Turtle Lake No Bid
March 3 2015 (280C 018 S 1,251.59 | S 1,251.59 | $ - Taylor, J Seay, N\Ross L
March 3 2015 (288 004 S 23,785.62 No Bid S - Hampton Isl No Bid
March 3 2015|288 008 S 24,715.26 No Bid S - Hampton Isl No Bid
March 3 2015 (289 035 S 43,438.85 No Bid S - Deluca-Eat No Bid
Day of Sale | Successful Bid

Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Sept 2 2014 (009 002 S 1,541.28 | $ 1,541.28 | S - Epling, Max Stewart, Meritta
Sept 2 2014 |031 012 S 1,826.11 | No Bid S - Roberts, W No Bid

Sept 2 2014 (031B 004 S 1,720.08 | No Bid S - Lyles, Gwen No Bid

Sept 2 2014 |190 016 S 2,490.22 | No Bid S - Butler, A Est No Bid

Sept 2 2014 (195019 S 1,279.14 | S 1,279.14 | $ - Stokes, Mary Houston, Tommy
Sept 2 2014 |238B 210 S 498.88 | No Bid S - Tapley, Ellie No Bid

Sept 2 2014 (238B 240 S 537.42 | No Bid S - Taylor,Julius No Bid

Sept 2 2014 (238D 137 S 516.90 | $ 516.90 | S - Jones, T Horne, Walter
Sept 2 2014 |238D 256 S 486.67 | S 486.67 | S - Barzani, R Herrington, Jerry
Sept 2 2014 |249A 002 S 1,796.52 | No Bid S - Bacon, V No Bid

Sept 2 2014 |260A 059 S 730.28 | No Bid S - Roberson No Bid

Sept 2 2014 |260A 088 S 479.24 | No Bid S - Shuman, G No Bid

Day of Sale | Successful Bid

Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
June 32014 (045D 084 S 4,340.42 No bid Sims, John Sims, John Mc




June 32014 (052A 025 S 1,525.30 | S 2,025.00 | S 499.70 Lee, Ollie Houston, Tommy
June 3 2014 (270025 S 37,368.24 No Bid S - Turtle Lake No Bid
June 32014 (280C 100 S 3,033.98 No Bid S - Nelson, S No Bid
June 3 2014 |288 004 S 22,095.23 No Bid S - Hampton Is No Bid
June 32014 |288 008 S 23,053.01 No Bid S - Hampton Is No Bid
June 3 2014 |289 014 S 22,600.87 No Bid S - Cole, Bill No Bid
June 3 2014 |289 016 S 8,156.81 No Bid S - Lyle, Wayne No Bid
June 32014 (289 035 S 40,476.77 No Bid S - Deluca-Eat No Bid

Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments

EXCESS FUNDS

April 12014 |034C010 S 4,657.24 ]S 30,000.00 | S 25,342.46 |Loury, M Jones, Lewis & G CLAIMED
April 12014 (036A 031 S 2,277.38 | $ 3,500.00 | S 1,222.62 |Leach, Eric Clark, Pete
April 12014 [051A 012 S 2,821.76 | S 2,821.76 | $ - |Baker, L McCartney, Jamie
April 12014 |051A 066 S 1,374.94 No Bid S - Roberts C No Bid
April 12014 (141 085 S 2,984.89 | $ 2,984.89 | $ - Lloyd, J Walton, James C
April 12014 (166B 008 S 1,160.35 | $ 1,160.35 | S - |walden, S Houston, Tommy
April 12014 [179 012 S 1,587.87 | $ 1,587.87 | $ - |Sigler, John Walton, James C
April 12014 (191D 020 S 383.53| S 383.53 | S - |Coleman, G Houston, Tommy
April 12014 [219A 004 S 427.01 No Bid S - Gurganus, K No Bid
April 12014 |238B 088 S 598.11 | S 598.11 | $ - Mena, F Smith, Calvin Hollis
April 1 2014 (238D 089 S 649.47 | S 649.47 | S - Hamilton, J Slade, Earl
April 12014 (238D 102 S 537.79 | S 537.79 | $ - Hamilton, J Slade, Earl
April 12014 (239D 078 S 1,653.86 No Bid S - Hutcheson No Bid
April 12014 |260A 048 S 570.87 | S 570.87 | $ - |Cook, Melvin Miller, Richard
April 12014 |260A 059 S 553.20 No Bid S - Roberson, W No Bid
April 12014 |260C 194 S 3,727.03 | S 3,727.03 | $ - Williams, B MJTrust2, LLC
April 12014 |280C 088 S 1,49497 | S 1,494.97 | $ - Foster, Erma Scott, Matthew
April 12014 |280C 100 S 2,905.06 No Bid S - Nelson, S No Bid
April 12014 |289 014 S 21,823.21 No Bid S - Cole, Bill No Bid
April 12014 (289 016 S 7,980.06 No Bid S - |Lyle Wayne No Bid




April 12014 (289 035 S 39,726.66 No Bid S - Deluca-Eat No Bid
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
July 22013 044D 095 S 1,01897 |S 1,018.97 | S - Fairbrook Ligon, Joan
July 22013 [121 048 S 6,787.73|$ 10,000.00 | $ 3,212.27 Proctor, A Moseley, Latonia
July 22013 |238B 321 S 797.05|$ 500.00 | $ - Fagan, H Gough, Sidney A
July 22013 |241B 009 S 667.27 | $ 667.27 | S - Giles, Alfred Stevens, Lloyd
July 22013 |260C 210 S 1,624.95|S 4,600.00 | $ 2,975.05 Smith, M Patrick, Gary
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
EXCESS FUNDS
April 22013 |260C 203 S 1,850.99|$ 3,000.00 | $ 1,149.01 Dempsey, B Patrick, Gary CLAIMED
April 22013 |281D 011 S 3,050.14 | S 3,050.14 | S - Calhoun, K Graham, Stanford
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
March 5 2013 (026D 002 S 3,142.13 No Bid S - Indep. Settl No Bid
March 5 2013 (044D 149 S 5,414.54 No Bid S - Richards, S No Bid
EXCESS FUNDS
March 5 2013 |046B 140 S 1,74436 | S 2,150.00 | S 405.64 Dunn Jones, Neal CLAIMED
March 5 2013 (238A 037 S 500.00 | S 500.00( S - Patrick, T Rush, Tammy
March 5 2013 [238A 084 S 715.12 | S 910.00| $ 194.88 Deloach, D Anderson, Earl
March 5 2013 |238A 085 S 712.00 | $ 1,475.00 | $ 763.00 Deloach, D Powell, Davin
March 5 2013 [260C 084 S 475.18 | $ 860.00| $ 384.82 Dumont, R Robinson, Shan.
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Sept 4 2012 (030B 001 S 883.76 | § 1,500.00 | S 666.24 BLM Inc Jackson, Essie M




Sept 4 2012 (030B 091 S 1,210.29 | S 3,500.00 2,289.71 BLM Inc Jackson, Essie M
EXCESS FUNDS
Sept 4 2012 |045B 284 S 2686811 S 3,500.00 813.19 Perkins Parks, Ricky CLAIMED
EXCESS FUNDS
Sept 4 2012 |050A 165 S 742811 $ 1,000.00 257.19 Murray, Wm Stewart, Merita CLAIMED
Sept 4 2012 |051A 066 No Bid No Bid Roberts, C No Bid
Sept 4 2012 |051C 086 S 546140 S 5,461.40 S Strickland, J Stewart, Merita
Sept 42012 (104 019 S 2,001.041(S 2,001.04 S Gonzalez, A Walton, James
Sept 42012 (238A 037 S 42099 | $ 700.00 *Voided* Patrick, T Voided
Sept 4 2012 [251 030 S 72845| S 1,000.00 271.55 Sellens, J Jackson, Essie M
Sept 4 2012 [260A 030 No Bid No Bid No Bid Davis, D No Bid
EXCESS FUNDS
Sept 4 2012 |270 007 S 2,537.16| $ 4,500.00 1,962.84 Reflections HI, LLC CLAIMED
EXCESS FUNDS
Sept 4 2012 (270 008 S 252797 1| $ 4,600.00 2,072.03 Reflections HI, LLC CLAIMED
EXCESS FUNDS
Sept 4 2012 |270 009 S 252797 1| $ 4,500.00 1,972.03 Vinings HI, LLC CLAIMED
Sept 4 2012 |270 025 No bid No Bid No Bid Turtle Lake No Bid
EXCESS FUNDS
Sept 4 2012 (270028 S 2,527.97 | S 4,900.00 2,372.03 Reflections HI, LLC CLAIMED
EXCESS FUNDS
Sept 4 2012 |270 029 S 2,627.97 | S 6,100.00 3,472.03 Hampton Is HI, LLC CLAIMED
Sept 4 2012 |288 004 No Bid No Bid No Bid Hampton Is No Bid
Sept 4 2012 |288 008 No Bid No Bid No Bid Hampton Is No Bid
Sept 42012 (289 007 S 8,567.33|S 8,567.33 - Vinings HI, LLC
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Aug 62012 |026D 002 S 2,794.51 | No Bid No Bid Genesis No Bid
Aug 62012 |048C 030 S 1,679.57|$ 5,000.00 | $ 3,320.43 | Honeycutt Baker, John
Aug 62012 |140025 S 2,269.92 | No Bid No Bid GreenTree No Bid
Aug 6 2012 159 002 S 3,94583 |$ 3,945.83 | S - Houston, S Grooms, Chris
Aug 6 2012 238A 084 S 449.13 | No Bid No Bid Deloach, D No Bid
Aug 6 2012 238A 085 S 446.68 | No Bid No Bid Deloach, D No Bid
Aug 62012  |238B 009 S 1,028.80 | No Bid No Bid Moneyline No Bid




Aug 62012 |238B 321 S 504.00 | No Bid No Bid Fagan, H No Bid
EXCESS FUNDS
Aug 62012 (240D 008 S 837.48 | S 1,500.00 | S 662.52 Turner, H Patrick, Gary CLAIMED
Aug 6 2012 242D 007 S 692.82 | $ 692.82 | $ - Price, R Grooms, Chris
Aug 6 2012 250 001 S 31,641.45 (S 31,641.45 | $ - Retreat SDS Rental Inc
Aug 6 2012 260C 204 S 2,089.92 |S 2,089.92 | S - Mann, D Patrick, Gary
Aug 6 2012 289 035 S 30,932.14 | No Bid No Bid Deluca-Eat No Bid
Aug 62012 |306 091 S 831.52 |S 1,800.00 | $ 968.48 | Snipes, Wm Stewart, Merita
Aug 62012  [353A 005 S 3,555.67 |$ 3,555.67 | $ - Smith, K Vogt, David M
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Oct 4 2011 260A 075 S 508.71 $508.71 S - Gordon, Wm Mobley,] & Troha S
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Sept 62011 [046D101030 (S 2,609.60 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 590.40 | Rogers, P Stewart, Merrita
Sept 62011 |050A 165 S 458.56 No Bid No Bid Murray, Wm. No Bid
Sept 62011 |051A 066 S 738.01 No Bid No Bid Roberts, C. No Bid
Sept 6 2011 |055C 039 S 1,399.77 | $ 1,399.77 | $ - Ibanez, L. Stewart, Merrita
Sept 62011 |071B014 S 2,002.54 No Bid No Bid WLN Devel. No Bid
Sept 62011 |238A 053 S 498.28 | § 498.28 Smith, Ruth Giddens, Freddie
Sept 62011 |238D 111 S 47544 | S 475.44 | S - Orr, Joyce Hayes, L & Dean D
Sept 62011 238D 122 S 500.64 | S 500.64 | $ - |Deason, R Hayes, L & Dean D
Sept 62011 |238D 123 S 52098 | S 750.00 | S 229.02 | Deason, R Hayes, L & Dean D
Sept 62011 265003 S 10,698.52 No Bid No Bid DEA Enterp. No Bid
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Aug22011 |238B 143 S 62371 S 1,400.00 | S 776.29 | Shoemaker Cappuchi, Anth.
Aug 2 2011 260A 060 S 547.36 | S 725.00 | $ 177.64 | Wright, W Dean, Diane
Aug22011 |260A 061 S 550.74 | $ 550.74 | $ - |Wright, W Dean, Diane
Aug 2 2011 260A 062 S 530.82 | S 530.82 | $ - Wright, W Dean, Diane
Aug22011 |260A 071 S 550.74 | $ 550.74 Vallion, E Whitehead, Ray P.
Aug 2 2011 260A 084 S 582.39 | S 582.39 | $ - Pelote, P Hayes, L & Dean D
Aug 2 2011 260A 091 S 54155 | S 541.55 | $ - Meek, Jehu Hayes, L & Dean D




Aug 22011 |260C 085 S 530.18 | S 625.00 | S 94.82 | Daniels, L Hayes, L & Dean D
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
EXCESS FUNDS
May 3 2011 |036C 003 S 1,552.00($ 16,000.00 | $ 14,448.00 Liberty Land Southeastern Com. |CLAIMED
May 3 2011 |045D 084 S 2,326.62 | No Bid No Bid Sims, John No Bid
May 3 2011 |058B 026 S 1,203.99 S 1,203.99 | $ - |Hack, AliciaH & Taylor, Julius
May 3 2011 104 019 S 1,410.67 | No Bid No Bid Gonzales, A. No Bid
EXCESS FUNDS
May 3 2011 |187B 015 S 1,695.15|$ 8,500.00 | $ 6,804.85 | Harrison, J. Stewart, Meritta CLAIMED
May 3 2011 [238B 240 S 832401 $ 83240 | S - Baxley, L. Taylor, Julius
May 3 2011 [260A 063 S 703.77 | $ 703.77 | $ - Wright, Wm Taylor, Julius
May 3 2011 [260A 110 S 2,107.00| S 2,200.00 | $ 93.00 | Williams, L. Patrick, Gary
May 32011 (261D 073 S 1,493.17 | $ 1,600.00 | S 106.83 | Sanders, S Cavin, Zane
May 3 2011 (280C 018 S 1641401 S 1,641.40 | S - Ashburn, A Taylor, Julius
May 3 2011 |360C 023 S 7,413.00| S 7,413.00 | $ - |All Season Counts, John Mark
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Feb 12011 072A 016 S 1,891.34 |S 1,891.34 Hack, Orion Ligon, Joan
Feb 12011 238B 204 S 500.00 | $ 500.00 | $ - Sanders, T Hayes, L& F
Feb 12011 260A 058 S 905.98 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 94.02 | Shoemaker Patrick, G.
Feb 1 2011 260A 073 S 48561 | S 485.61 | S - Shoemaker Ryan, Christopher
Feb 1 2011 260A 141 $ 3,259.55
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
Sept 72010 |022 080 S 687.64]|S 2,850.00 | $ 317.11 | Cannon, S. Stewart, M.
Sept 72010 |034 001 $ 97598 $ 1,250.00 | $ 274.02 | Yocom, J. Stewart, M.
Sept 72010 |149 005 S 442611 S 700.00 | $ 257.39 | Alvin, J. Stewart, M.
Sept 7 2010 238D 265 S 558.97 | § 1,250.00 | S 691.03 | Rawlings, V Stanczak, Kevin
Sept 72010 |[103011 S 390.21|$ 800.00 | $ 409.79 | Golden, D. Bryant, Gregory
Sept 72010 |260C 052 S 548.04 | S 548.04 | $ - Charlses, D. Stanczak, Kevin
Sept 72010 |238B 323 S 559.82 | $ 559.82 | $ - Roberts, G. LHayes/DDean




Sept 72010 [238D 323 S 490.82 | $ 490.82 | S - |witt, C& W LHayes/DDean
Sept 72010 |058B011 S 864.33|S$ 864.33 | S - |Palmetto Be Seen/MlJones
Sept7 2010 |260A 093 S 504.80 | $ 504.80 | $ - |Coffrin, G&J LHayes/DDean
Sept 72010 |047A18904F |S 4,158.81 | S 4,158.81 | S - Vazquez, A. Southern ComCon
Sept7 2010 |052C 003 S 649.86 | S 649.86 | S - Dykes Stewart, M.
Sept 72010 |031011 S 1,413.40 1| $ 1,413.40 | S - Roberts, J Stewart, M.
Sept7 2010 |238B 092 S 584.87 | $ 584.87 | $ - |Tewell, A. Stewart, M.
Sept 7 2010 040D 031 S 1,238.20| $ 1,238.20 | $ - St.Johns Stewart, M.
Sept 7 2010 148 057 S 508.54 | $ 508.54 | S - Alvin, J Stewart, M.
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
July 6 2010 259 020 S 3,146.86 | S 9,050.00 | $ 5,903.14 | Sparks Newlin, Fred
July 6 2010 260 096 S 2,421.14 1S 3,000.00 | $ 578.86 | Morgan Phelphs, Tracy
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
April 62010 |039B 023 S 809.52 | $ 809.52 | $ - Chance Haberbosch, Mark
April 6 2010 |164 003 S 642.71 | S 642.71 | S - George Salter, Gene
April 6 2010 |241A 012 S 4,002.22 |S 4,002.22 | $ - Miller Heritage Bank
April 62010 |238B 204 S 488.89 | No Bid S - Sanders No Bid
Day of Sale | Successful Bid
Date of Sale Parcel Amt. Amt. Excess Funds |CRH Successful Bidder Comments
EXCESS FUNDS
Nov. 32009 |052B 021 S 3,92892|$ 40,000.00 | $ 36,071.08 Higgins Assoc.Partners CLAIMED
Nov. 32009 |211010 S 43991 |$ 1,500.00 | S 1,060.09 Byrd Trimuel, Dominic
Nov.3 2009 (238B 154 S 51343 |§ 513.43 | $ - Cleveland L. Hayes
Nov. 32009 |260A 037 S 46161 |$ 750.00 | S 288.39 Edwards L. Hayes
Nov. 32009 (260A 039 S 464.44 S 464.44 | S - Edwards L. Hayes




